State of Oklahoma

Division of Capital Asset Management BID TABULATION SHEET
Construction and Properties Department
Project Name: Sequoyah Lodge Interior Remodel CAP Project Number: 14210
Project Location: Sequoyah State Park - Hulbert, OK Bid Date: 7/1/2014

Using Agency:

Oklahoma Tourism and Recreation Department

Project Manager:

Rebekah Richardson

Bidder's Name:

WOOD SYSTEMS, INC

JBH CONSTRUCTION, INC

MWE SERVICES, INC - DBA MIDWEST

DEMOLITION
City, State: TULSA, OK TULSA, OK LINCOLN, NE
Notes: PACKAGE 6A PACKAGE 8C PACKAGE 2A
Bid Scty[ X Affidavits| X Bid Scty[ X Affidavits| X Bid Scty[ X Affidavits| X
Days Addendums| 2 Days Addendums| 2 Days Addendums| 2
Base Bid $257,950.00 $80,530.00 $157,300.00
ALTERNATES
Alternate #1 NA NA
Alternate #2 NA NA
Alternate #3 NA $5,300.00
Alternate #4a NA $7,800.00 $800.00
Alternate #4b NA $800.00
Alternate #5 NA $1,800.00
Alternate #6 NA $2,900.00
Alternate #7 $5,127.00 NA
Alternate #8 $11,524.00 NA
UNIT PRICES
Description Price Per Each Price Per Each Price Per Each
Unit Price #1 NA NA
Unit Price #2 NA NA
Unit Price #3 NA NA
Unit Price #4 NA NA
Unit Price #5 NA NA
Unit Price #6 NA NA
Bidder's Name: STOCK BUILDING SUPPLY ALLIANCE ELECTRICAL ARCHITECTURAL MATERIALS CO., INC
CONTRACTORS, INC
City, State: SPRINGDALE, AR TULSA, OK SPRINGFIELD, MO
Notes: PACKAGE 9C PACKAGE 26A PACKAGE 108
Bid Scty| X Affidavits| X Bid Scty| X Affidavits| X Bid Scty| X Affidavits| X
Days Addendums| 2 Days Addendums| 2 Days Addendums| 2
Base Bid $416,500.00 $446,980.00 $71,422.00
ALTERNATES
Alternate #1 NO BID NA NONE
Alternate #2 $23,500.00 NA NONE
Alternate #3 NO BID NA NONE
Alternate #4a $49,000.00 NA NONE
Alternate #4b NO BID NA NONE
Alternate #5 NO BID NA NONE
Alternate #6 NO BID NA NONE
Alternate #7 NO BID $8,830.00 $720.00
Alternate #8 NO BID NA NONE
UNIT PRICES
Description Price Per Each Price Per Each Price Per Each
Unit Price #1 NO BID $172.00 $0.00
Unit Price #2 NO BID $162.00 $0.00
Unit Price #3 NO BID NA $0.00
Unit Price #4 NO BID NA $0.00
Unit Price #5 NO BID NA $0.00
Unit Price #6 NO BID $433.00 $0.00




Bidder's Name:

MACINTOSH SERVICES, INC.

COMMERCIAL FLOORING SOLUTIONS

ARK WRECKING CO.
OF OKLAHOMA, INC

City, State: TULSA, OK JENKS, OK TULSA, OK
Notes: PACKAGE 22A PACKAGE 9C PACKAGE 2A
Bid Scty[ X Affidavits| X Bid Scty| X Affidavits| X Bid Scty Affidavits| X
Days Addendums| 2 Days Addendums| 2 Days Addendums| 2
Base Bid $258,593.00 $468,362.00 $155,000.00
ALTERNATES
Alternate #1 NA NA NA
Alternate #2 NA $17,505.00 NA
Alternate #3 NA NA NA
Alternate #4a $128,000.00 $4,187.00 NOBID
Alternate #4b $210,000.00 -$7,900.00 NO BID
Alternate #5 $80,200.00 NA NO BID
Alternate #6 $10,000.00 NA NO BID
Alternate #7 NA NA NA
Alternate #8 NA NA NA
UNIT PRICES
Description Price Per Each Price Per Each Price Per Each
Unit Price #1 NA NA NA
Unit Price #2 NA NA NA
Unit Price #3 NA NA NA
Unit Price #4 NA NA NA
Unit Price #5 NA NA NA
Unit Price #6 NA NA NA
Bidder's Name: 2 J'S ELECTRIC, INC ARCHITECTURAL GLASS BUILDERS SUPPLY, INC
AND METALS, INC
City, State: PRYOR, OK FORT SMITH, AR TULSA, OK
Notes: PACKAGE 26A PACKAGE 8B PACKAGE 8A
Bid Scty[ X Affidavits| X Bid Scty Affidavits| X Bid Scty! Affidavits| X
Days Addendums| 2 Days Addendums| 1 Days Addendums| 2
Base Bid $443,050.00 $19,952.00 $135,000.00
ALTERNATES
Alternate #1 NA NA
Alternate #2 NA NA
Alternate #3 NA NA
Alternate #4a $123,500.00 NA
Alternate #4b NA NA
Alternate #5 NA NA
Alternate #6 NA NA
Alternate #7 $11,245.00 NA NA
Alternate #8 NA NA
UNIT PRICES
Description Price Per Each Price Per Each Price Per Each
Unit Price #1 $234.00 NA NA
Unit Price #2 $250.00
$217.00 NA NA
<200 00
Unit Price #3 NA NA
Unit Price #4 NA NA
Unit Price #5 NA NA
Unit Price #6 $291.00 NA NA




Bidder's Name: SOUTHWEST DRYWALL, LLC FADCO, INC SOUTHWEST DRYWALL, LLC
City, State: TULSA, OK TULSA, OK TULSA, OK
Notes: PACKAGE 9B PACKAGE 6A 9A
Bid Scty| X Affidavits Bid Scty[ X Affidavits| X Bid Scty! Affidavits| X
Days Addendums Days Addendums| 2 Days Addendums| 2
Base Bid $344,770.00 $367,800.00 $247,000.00
ALTERNATES
Alternate #1 $37,770.00 NO BID NA
Alternate #2 NA NO BID NA
Alternate #3 $0.00 NO BID $7,700.00
Alternate #4a NA NO BID $7,000.00
Alternate #4b NA NO BID $7,000.00
Alternate #5 NA NO BID NA
Alternate #6 $0.00 NO BID $219,700.00
Alternate #7 $0.00 NO BID $9,700.00
Alternate #8 NA $17,758.00 NA
UNIT PRICES
Description Price Per Each Price Per Each Price Per Each
Unit Price #1 NA NO BID NA
Unit Price #2 NA NO BID NA
Unit Price #3 NA NO BID NA
Unit Price #4 NA NO BID NA
Unit Price #5 NA NO BID $3.70
Unit Price #6 NA NO BID NA
Bidder's Name: BEST COMPANIES
City, State: EDMOND, OK
Notes: PACKAGE 10B
Bid Scty[ X Affidavits| X Bid Scty Affidavits Bid Scty! Affidavits
Days Addendums| 2 Days Addendums Days Addendums
Base Bid $82,200.00 $ $
ALTERNATES
Alternate #1 $ $
Alternate #2 $ $
Alternate #3 $ $
Alternate #4a $ $
Alternate #4b $ $
Alternate #5 $ $
Alternate #6 $ $
Alternate #7 $4,600.00 $ $
Alternate #8 $ $
UNIT PRICES
Description Price Per Each Price Per Each Price Per Each
Unit Price #1 $ $
Unit Price #2 $ $
Unit Price #3 $ $
Unit Price #4 $ $
Unit Price #5 $ $
Unit Price #6 $ $






